AGENDA REQUEST FORM

Accept, Award and/or Reject County Bid #SHE-2153

Name of Person Submitting Request: Keri Lyles
Address: Purchasing Dept.
Phone: (405) 366-0224
Date Requested: 4/27/2026

Description of Agenda Item Including purpose for consideration by Board of County
Commissioners (include type of Motion requested).

Price Increase on #SHE-2153 page 8 trash bags with Unipak.

Due to price increase on_trash bags page 8 of bid SHE-2153 Inmate and Detention Center Supplies - Purchasing

Requesting three (3) quotes be required when purchasing trash bags from the bid.

See attached paperwork verifying increase.

Please put under consent items

Internal Use Only
Received By:

Acknowledge: (Chairman) Date Assigned:
(Member) Applicant Notified:
(Member) Routine (Consent) Item:

Other Parties Notified:




CLEVELAND COUNTY AWARD SUMMARY

List of Individual Bidders
Acme Supply Admiral ICS Jail Midstate South Central 1
Co. Express, LLC Boh Barkec Supplies Services Inc. Industries U=k F Fagef
BID:  #SHE-2153 - = o - I
DATE OPENED: 6/2/2025 - 1 [
. ) S S | o — =
40 qt Fire Resistant,
Fiberglass Waste
Basket (appox. Sz 11
1/4"x15x20.:
2 rycase: NoBid NoBid |  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid ~ NoBid
BRAND NAME: No Bid No Bid | No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM NUMBER: No Bid ~ NoBid | No Bid | ~ NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid |
COST: o No Bid No Bid No Bid __NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid
43"x48" Trash Bags,
Opaque, 14-16 mic
Natural Liner, 56 gal.: |
— | e
2 ri/CASE: No Bid 20/Roll 10rls/Case No Bid No Bid 25/Roll 8rls/Case | 25/Roll 8rls/Case | 20/Roll 10rls/Case
. Required 3
BRAND NAME No Bid OFD | No Bid No Bid Napco NCSR (Vo quotes
ITEM NUMBER: PE} Biq 791130 | No Bi[? No Bid NR434EI_6_NIK 4§48}5N | 434814N
COST: No Bid [ $46.25 No Bid No Bid $26.28 $24.33 $17.10
33"x40" Trash Bags, |
14-16 mic Natural
Liner, Opaque:
? rl/CASE: No Bid 25/Roll 10rls/Case No Bid No Bid 25/Roll 10rls/Case | 25/Roll 10rls/case | 25/Roll 10rlsCase
BRAND NAME: NoBid | 1855 _ No Bid No Bid Napco ~ NCSR ~upc “‘qquu“ot;d 9
ITEM NUMBER: N No Bid 334016N | NoBid No Bid NCSR334016 N/K | 334016N 33403
cos. NoBid | 56531 No Bid ~ No Bid $18.89 $21.15 $13.90
24"x33" Trash Bags,
14-16 mic Natural
Liner, Opaque:
? rl/CASE: No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 500/Case 50/Roll 20rls/Case
BRANDNAME: No Bid | NoBd ‘ NoBd | NoBid No Bid NR uPC Requq“:t;d =
ITEM NUMBER: _No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid ~ NogBid 243312N ~ 2433R
COST: | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.50 $24.00
| [ I
Mop Handle 60", Side- Preference:
H"‘*‘L o - Admiral
? ea/CASE: No Bid 1/Ea 1/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid 1 Each No Bid Express due to
[BRAND NAME: No Bid c] No Bid No Bid No Bid BWK ~ NoBid having a
ITEM NUMBER No Bid 80160 No Bid No Bid No Bid 620 No Bid fiberglass
COST: No Bid $19.43 No Bid - No Bid No Bid $9.38 No Bid andle
Heavy Duty Warehouse
Corn Broom with
Approx. 1" diameter |
handle,(string binding
only) | i
Admiral
?ealCASE: No Bid 1/Ea 1/Case | NoBid No 8id No Bid NoBid | NoBid E:i'l:’: n°:o
BRAND NAME: i No Bid GJ 1 No afd No B?‘d | No B?d No de No Bid :Em i uels‘
ITEM NUMBER: No Bid 12001 No Bid No Bid ~ NoBid No Bid No Bid
cosT: No Bid | $15.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid




ExxonMobil Product Solutions Company Peir Fen Sung
22777 Springwoods Village Parkway Americas Sales Manager
Spring, TX 77389 Polyelhylene

Ex¢onMobil

April 8, 2026

Dear Valued Customer:

ExxonMobil Product Solutions Company restate the previously announced increase of $0.20/Ib to a new
price increase of $0.30/Ib with effective date as April 1. This price increase applies to all polyethylene
resins.

Your sales representative will be in contact with you to discuss specific prices on the grades you
purchase and answer any questions that you may have. We value your business and thank you for the
opportunity to continue to serve your polyethylene resin needs.

We are currently monitoring the ongoing situation very closely, and that may require us to notify you of
further changes above and beyond what is stated in this letter.

Sincerely,

"L(f/

Peir Fen Sung
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CHEMICAL

April 9, 2026

RE: April 2026 Polyethylene Price Increase Announcement - Revised

Dear Valued Customer:

Chevron Phillips Chemical (“Chevron Phillips”) is revising the previously announced $0.20 per pound
price increase for all polyethylene products effective April 1, 2026, to a $0.30 per pound price
increase effective date of April 1, 2026

Please contact your Chevron Phillips Marlex® polyethylene sales representative with any questions
you may have regarding polyethylene pricing and current industry conditions. Thank you for your
business and allowing us to continue supplying your polyethylene needs.

Sincerely,

Annamarie Schuering Jerry J Smith

US/Canada Sales Manager International & Distribution Sales Manager
Polyethylene Polyethylene

T & S P SN Tl S A P P AT e A iR A O T T s e N T g R e T S T I e R S T R R TR
Chevron Phillips Chemical Company LP 9500 Lakeside Bivd., The Woodlands, TX 77381 1.800.231.1212 www.cpchem.com
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"l INTERNATIONAL

April 8, 2026

Dear Customer:

NOVA Chemicals is revising the previously announced price increase of twenty cenls per pound
($0.20 USD/b.} for all grades of NOVAPOL®, SCLAIR®, and SURPASS® resins effective

April 1, 2026, to a price increasae of thirty cents per pound ($0.30 USD/Ib.) effective April 1, 2026,
or as otherwise zllowed by contract.

If you have any questions about producl availability, pricing, or your currenl orders, please
do not hesitate to reach out to your NOVA Chemicals Account Manager. We appreciale
your continued partnership.

Sincerely,

Jim Worby

Vice President Polyethylene Sales, NOVA Chemicals Inc.

O Chmemcai e 1412 490 4500
1535 Corpopomm Heart oss

Hoon Townihg. PA 15108

usa aovasnamie sy com
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1531 NW 12% Avenue
ex Pompano Beach, FL 33069
Sales: 800-231-4191

PACKAGING Administrative: 954-956-1100

OF THE SIGMA PLASTICS GROUP www.isoflexpackaging.com

March 27, 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

Ongoing global supply chain disruptions, energy market volatility, and continued production
constraints have significantly impacted the availability and cost of polyethylene globally. These
factors are tightening supply across North America and driving rapid upward pressure on resin pricing.
Our suppliers have announced a further price increase for April as market conditions remain highly
dynamic.

In response to these continued resin cost increases, ISOFlex Packaging will implement a price
increase of 20%, effective on all new orders placed on or after April 20, 2026.

All orders must call for inmediate delivery. Due to severely constrained resin availability and
ongoing supply uncertainty, ISOFlex Packaging will strictly limit order volumes and allocation.

Order acceptance will be prioritized based on available resin supply, and we may be unable to fulfill
all requested quantities. ISOFlex Packaging reserves the right to accept or decline any order, in whole
or in part, at our sole discretion.

We recognize the significant impact this increase may have on your business and do not take this
decision lightly. These actions are necessary to ensure continuity of supply in an extremely
constrained market. Your ISOFlex Packaging sales representative is available to work closely with
you to help navigate these changes and provide the most up-to-date information possible.

We sincerely appreciate your understanding, continued partnership, and support.

Thank you for your continued support and we value your business.

Sincerely,

Robient Barbanti

Robert Barlanti
President

%SQF Level 3 Certified
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Dow Packaging & Specialty Plastics
Price Update

Price Increase Implementation for April 2026 and Price Increase for
May 2026

April 13'", 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

The Dow Chemical Company and Dow Chemical Canada ULC ("Dow") will be implementing the
previously-announced US$0.30/Ib price increase for all HDPE/LLDPE/LDPE resins sold in the United
States and Canada, respectively, effective April 1%, 2026, or as otherwise allowed by contract.

In addition, Dow will increase the price for all HDPE/LLDPE/LDPE resins sold in the United States and
Canada, respectively, by US$0.20/Ib effective May 1%, 2026, or as otherwise allowed by contract.

Your local Dow representative will contact you to answer any questions you may have regarding these
price movements.

We appreciate your continued business.

Sincerely,

Ahmad Kawas

North America Commercial Vice President
Packaging and Specialty Plastics

The Dow Chemical Company

®™Trademark of The Dow Chemical Company ("Dow”) or an affiliated company of Dow



A INEOS USA LLC
a/b’a INEOS Olefins & Polymers USA
\ { 2600 South Shora Boulevard
Suite 500

League Cily, Texas 77573

Olefins & Polymers e
USA

March 18, 2026
RE: Notification of HDPE Price Increase
Dear Valued Customer,

Effective April 1, 2026, INEOS Olefins & Polymers USA (“INEOS”) will implement a $0.15-per-pound price increase
on all high-density polyethylene (HDPE) resins. This is in addition to the $0.10-per-pound price increase announced

on March 3,2026.

Your INEOS Account Manager will be In contact with you to discuss any questions you may have about this increase.
Thank you for choosing INEOS as your HDPE supplier and for giving us the opportunity to serve your needs.

Sincerely,

ALID lggjﬂTU
ICBAMC

W. RADABAUGH
Vice President, Commercial
on.radabaugh@ineos.com




AN
\-/ Formosa Plastics Corporation, U.S.A.

Formosa Plastics’ g Peach Tree Hill Road
Livingston, NJ 07039
Telephone: (973)-992-2090

April 6, 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

Formosa Plastics Corporation, U.S.A., on behalf of Formosa Plastics Corporation, Texas and
Formosa Industries Corporation, will be fully implementing our previously communicated price
increases for March, 2026 and April, 2026.

In addition, effective May [, 2026, Formosa Plastics Corporation, U.S.A., on behalf of Formosa
Plastics Corporation, Texas and Formosa Industries Corporation, will implement a price increase of
$0.10 (ten cents) per pound for all Formolene® Polyethylene products. All shipments as of May 1,
2026 will reflect this increase.

Furthermore, where contractually permitted, all pricing structures currently based on prior-month
mechanisms (including, but not limited to, lag pricing, price protection, or similar arrangements) will
be transitioned to a current-month mechanism effective immediately.

Orders for all products will be subject to our ability to supply, based upon the normal operations of
our facilities.

Should you have any questions regarding this announcement please contact your Formosa Sales
Representative. We appreciate your business and look forward to continue serving your needs.

Sincerely,

Simon Hwang
Polyolefins Business
Division Head
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/\ Equistor Chemcals. LP
2800 Post Oak Bvd Suste 5100
|\Lvy LyondellBasell Hoution, TX 11088
LYB com
April 9, 2026

RE: Paolyethylene (PE) Price Increase April and May 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

Equistar Chemicals, LP is revising the announced price increase of $0.20/lb. to
$0.30/1b. for all grades of polyethylene sold in North America, effective April 1,
2026.

Equistar Chemicals, LP will implement the previously announced price increase
of $0.20/1b. for all grades of polyethylene sold in North America, effective May
1, 2026.

Equistar’s goal continues to be production of polyethylene in sufficient quantities
to fulfill current orders. Fulfillment of future orders (including those submitted
prior to the increase date) are subject to Equistar’s acceptance of each order and
our ability to supply product.

We appreciate your business and the confidence you have placed in us as a
supplier of your polyethylene needs. Your Account Manager can answer any
questions you may have regarding these price amendments.

Sincerely,
Brp HJJQ{{W

Brian K. Griffin
Vice President, Polymer Sales and Distribution, Americas
Equistar Chemicals, LP

Cc:  Equistar Sales
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PRICE INCREASE ANNOUNCEMENT March 24, 2026

Dear Valued Customer,

SABIC reaffirms our previously anncunced $0.10/Ib. PE price increase, effective March 1, 2026.
Additionally, SABIC is announcing a new $0.20/Ib. polyethylene price increase effective April 1,
2026. These price increases will apply for all polyethylene resins sold in the United States and
Canada.

We sincerely appreciate your business and look forward to working together to serve your

polyethylene needs. Your SABIC Account Manager will contact you to respond to any questions
or concerns that you may have related to product pricing.

Sincerely,
Olga Sessions

Polymer Sales Director, Americas

cc. SABIC AMR Sales Team

SABIC and brands marked with ™ are tredemarks of SABIC or its subsidiaries or affiliates.

SABIC
2500 CityWest Bivd., Sulte 100
Houston, TX 77042

www.sablc.com



