

File ID #

AGENDA REQUEST FORM

Agenda Item: _____ Accept, Award and/or Reject County _____
Name of Person Submitting Request: _____ Keri Lyles _____
Address: _____ Purchasing Dept. _____
Phone: _____ (405) 366-0224 _____
Date Requested: _____ 6/8/2026 _____

Description of Agenda Item Including purpose for consideration by Board of County Commissioners (include type of Motion requested).

Bid #BE-2155 Building Maintenance Supplies bid term from 7-1-25 thru 6-30-26

Treat' Solutions cannot provide the contracted price for trash bags due to increased cost in the petroleum products. Please get 3 quotes when purchasing attached items.

Internal Use Only

Received By: _____
Acknowledge: _____ (Chairman) Date Assigned: _____
_____ (Member) Applicant Notified: _____
_____ (Member) Routine (Consent) Item: _____

Other Parties Notified: _____

Keri Lyles

From: Shane Treat <STreat@treatssolutions.com>
Sent: Monday, June 1, 2026 10:02 AM
To: kyles@clevelandcountyok.com
Subject: Trash bags
Attachments: Quote_Q012403_62776367.PDF

Ms. Lyles,

Lisa, reached out needing a few cases of trash bags. Due to the unforeseen circumstances that have happened overseas in the middle east and the resulting increase to the price of petroleum products, we cannot offer trash bags at the contracted price. Likewise, one size I cannot get at this time, so the best I can do is offer an alternative. Please see the attached quote, It lists the number of cases I have available for purchase and the price per case for each. Please let me know if you have any questions or if any adjustments need to be made to the quote.

Shane Treat
streat@treatssolutions.com
Office: 405-787-8222
Cell: 580- 320-2685

#Roadto11

Treat's Solutions
Facility Supply & Management



CLEVELAND COUNTY BID SUMMARY

#BE-2155 Building Maintenance Supplies

Page 12

	Brady Industries	Dispose N' Save	Empire Paper Company	Lab Source Inc.	Mid-States Services, Inc.	NCH Corporation dba Chemsearch FE	South Central Industries	Treat's Solutions LLC	Unipak Corp.	
BID: #BE-2155										
List of Individual Items										
Trash Bags, heavy-duty, High Density, 43" x 48", .75 mil or better Roll:										
? RI / ? CASE:	No Bid	200/Case	25/rl 8/Case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25/rl 8/Case	250/Case	25/rl 8/Case	
BRAND NAME:	No Bid	Inteplast/Glopak	AFXZ8648VNFR	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NCSR	Triple S	UPC	
ITEM NUMBER:	No Bid	DPS4348-.75	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	434816N	SSS12447	4348 16N	
COST:	No Bid	\$25.32	\$32.12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.46	\$37.39	\$19.25	
Trash Bags, heavy-duty, High Density, 44" x 55", .75 Mil or better Roll:										
? RI / ? CASE:	No Bid	100/Case	20/rl 5/Case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	—————	10/rl 10/Case	
BRAND NAME:	No Bid	Inteplast/Glopak	AFXH8053PK	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Triple S	UPC	
ITEM NUMBER:	No Bid	DPS4455-.75		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	SSS72672	5575	
COST:	No Bid	\$14.34	\$37.52	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$34.86	\$15.50	
Trash Bags, Heavy-Duty, 16 gal, 24" x 32", .75 mil or better Roll:										
? RI / ? CASE:	No Bid	1000/Case	50/rl 10/Case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	50/rl 10/Case	500/Case	50/rl 20/Case	Preference: Treat's Solutions LLC
BRAND NAME:	No Bid	Inteplast/Glopak	AFXH4832RKRO	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	RM	Triple S	UPC	
ITEM NUMBER:	No Bid	DPS2433-.75	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2432H	SSS72051	243308N	
COST:	No Bid	\$31.82	\$21.74	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$35.76	\$38.62	\$16.85	
Outside Trash Bags, Black heavy-duty, 43" x 47", 1.5 mil. Roll:										
? RI / ? CASE:	No Bid	100/Case	20/rl 5/Case	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10/rl 10/Case	—————	10/rl 10/Case	
BRAND NAME:	No Bid	Inteplast/Glopak	AFXH8647PKFR	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	RM	Triple S	UPC	
ITEM NUMBER:	No Bid	DPS4347-1.5	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	434715	RP4466	4715	
COST:	No Bid	\$24.84	\$35.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.86	\$34.64	\$19.50	

CLEVELAND COUNTY BID SUMMARY
#BE-2155 Building Maintenance Supplies

[illegible]